County of Santa Cruz

COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE

701 OCEAN STREET, SUITE 520, SANTA CRUZ, CA 950604073
(831) 454-2100 FAX: (831) 454-3420 TDD: (831) 454-2123

SUSANA. MAURIELLO, J.D., COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVEOFFICER

AGENDA: June 2,2009
May 29,2009

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
County of Santa Cruz

701 Ocean Street

Santa Cruz CA 95060

RE: Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board
Dear Members of the Board:

Included as another item on this Agenda, is a letter dated May 18,2009 ,from
Supervisor Neal Coonerty, directing staff to return on June 16" with recommendations
for clarifying the role of the Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board
(BAFCAB). Supervisor Coonerty read the entire letter to the BAFCAB at its meeting
held on May 18". Based on actions taken by the BAFCAB at the May 18" meeting, and
subsequent failures by the BAFCAB to properly schedule the hearing of pending
appeals, staff is recommending that your Board take action at this time to assume the
role of hearing Building and Fire Code appeals brought pursuant to Chapter 12.12and
7.920f the County Code. This recommendation results from the failure of the current
BAFCAB to carry out its principal duty of hearing appeals, and that the BAFCAB has
taken actions in direct conflict with the existing law and the practices of the County
unnecessarilyadding to County and appellant expenses, and has conducted itself in a
manner that significantly exposes the County to litigation.

BACKGROUND

During 2008,the Board of Supervisors closely examined the County's regulations
governing the appeal of staff actions and determinations made on land use applications.
There were detailed staff reports prepared and significant public debate about State and
local legal requirements. This review was spurred by a long-term record of no Building
Code or Fire Code appeal being filed, resulting in the lack of a currently functioning local
board of appeal. Because there was no functional appeals board at the time, the Board
of Supervisors served as the local appeals board and continued in that role until the
Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board was reconstituted and new
members were appointed in January of this year.

Page 10f3 73, ]

SERVING THE COMMUNITY -WORKING FOR THE FUTURE



73.1

CURRENT STATUS

Although the newly reconstituted BAFCAB has now held three meetings, it has
failed to complete considerationof any appeal. Infact, of the two appeals pending, one
has been continued twice without even beginning a hearing (the Watson Appeal) while
the second (the Sunset Drive Appeal) was allocated a mere twenty minutes at the end of
a three hour meeting and could not be completed.

The Sunset Drive appellants came prepared with technical consultants and
experts arid initially implored the BAFCAB to move their appeal from the end of the
agenda so that final action could take place that evening. This request was
unfortunatelydenied. The County Fire Chief and his technical staff were also present
and fully preparedto have the Sunset Drive Appeal acted on. Soon after the Sunset
Drive Appeal hearing was begun, the BAFCAB elected to continue the hearing to an
uncertain date. Attempts by the BAFCAB's staff to make arrangements so that both the
Fire Code and Watson appeals could be heard on June 4, 2009, were halted by the
BAFCAB'; Chair. The Chair then attempted to schedule the hearing on his own by
contacting the appellantto negotiate a waiver of the ten day hearing notice required by
Section 12.12.050 of the County Code. The Chair was advised by staff that such a
waiver was not authorized and his role in seeking such a waiver potentially compromised
the integrity of the hearingitself. The Chair rejected this advice.

Instead of performing its primary function, that of hearing appeals, the BAFCAB
has spent most of its time addressing procedural matters and seeking to reexamine the
scope of its jurisdictional authority. The BAFCAB has allocated inordinate amounts of
time to reviewing minutes (even though a complete audio recoding of each meeting is
maintained by staff) and the Chair has proposed devoting months of meetings to revising
bylaws. The BAFCAB's focus on procedural matters is unjustified due to the mandatory
requirements of the Brown Act and local County ordinances establishing procedural
rules for accepting and hearing appeals. BAFCAB'’s concern about changing their

bylaws appears to be solely aimed at rehearing legal and policy matters already settled
by the Board of Supervisors.

The BAFCAB has directed staff to take actions in direct conflict with County
regulations and the prior actions of the Board of Supervisors, such as setting hearings
for matters clearly outside of itsjurisdiction. When staff has declined to take that
direction, the BAFCAB indicated its intent to take action on its own. Furthermore,
BAFCAB members have seemingly ignored staff guidance regarding the requirements
for communications under the open meeting laws of the State, and instead appear to
follow their own misguided legal conclusions. These actions have placed staff in the
untenable position of being directed in a manner inconsistent with the prior directions of
this Boarcl and the requirementsof our adopted regulations and State law.

Statements made by BAFCAB members in the press and at public meetings
indicate a belief that the County and its staff are acting in violation of State law. Staff
believesthat while these statements may be well intentioned, they are in error, grossly
misinformed and certainly misrepresent the position of the County. While BAFCAB
members are unquestionably entitled to their own opinions, we believe that they are
based on unfounded legal conclusions that erroneously apply State law and conflict with
our County Code. Significantly, several members of the BAFCAB now question whether

Page 2 of 3



they are able to apply the County’s lawfully adopted rules and regulations when hearing
and acting on appeals. These conflicts over the final regulatory and policy decisions
made by the Board of Supervisors are preventing the BAFCAB from performing its
primary function in hearing appeals. More importantly, such actions are exposing the
County to potential litigation.

Your Board has several options at this point. First, your Board could seek to
redirectthe BAFCAB so that its carries out its primary duties in hearing appeals.
Second, your Board could take immediate action to relieve the current BAFCAB
members from their continued service on the board pursuant to Section 2.38.100 C of
the County Code. Finally, your Board could act to adopt an ordinance amending the
County Code to eliminate the BAFCAB. In light of the foregoing, staff recommends that
you take both the second and third options as it would allow an immediate transfer of
authority to your Board to hear the currently pending appeals. Adoption of an ordinance
alone would require several weeks for it to become effective, delaying your Board’'s
ability to begin hearing appeals.

Staff has attached an ordinance that proposes several changes that would
eliminate the BAFCAB as the appeal board and effect a transfer of the appeals function
to the Board of Supervisorswhich is expressly authorized by State law. Should your
Board act to remove the current BAFCAB members now, staff can be directed to
immediately schedule and properly notice the currently pending appeals for a hearing
before your Board at the earliest possible time.

IT ISTHEREFORE RECOMMENDEDthat your Board:

1. Assume the responsibilityto act as the local appeals board under Health
and Safety Code § 17920.5 by removing the existing members of the Building,
Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board pursuant to subdivision C of Section
2.38.100 (requires a 4/5ths vote); and

2. Adopt in concept the attached ordinance repealing the establishment of
the Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board as recommended by the
County Administrative Officer and County Counsel; and

3. Have the proposed ordinance return on your next available agenda for
final action.
Very truly yours,
TS s, C 00—/
R WO N\ .
ANA McRAE SUSAN A. MAURIELLO
County Counsel County Administrative Officer

cc:  Members, Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board

S:\BOS Letter re BAFCAB.doc

Page 3 of 3
73



73.1

ORDINANCE NO.

ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTER 2.100; SUBDIVISION (b) OF SECTION
12.10.215 AND SECTION 12.12.080; AND AMENDING SECTIONS7.92.108.1,
12.10.150; 12.10.435;12.12.010; 12.12.020; AND 12.12.050 OF THE SANTA
CRUZ COUNTY CODE RELATING TO THE HEARING OF BUILDING,
ACCESSIBILITY,AND FIRE CODE APPEALS

Tihe Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz ordains as follows:
SECTIONI

Chapter 2.100 of the Santa Cruz County Code entitled “Building and Fire Code
Appeals Board” is hereby repealed.

SECTIONII

Subdivision(b) of Section 12.10.215 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby
repealed..

SECTIONIII
Section 12.12.080 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby repealed.
SECTION IV

Section 7.92.108.1 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

7.92.108.1 Section 108.1 amended—Board of appeals established.
Section 108.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of Santa Cruz County is amended to
read as follows:

108.1 - Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official
relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is
hereby created a Board of Appeals The Board of Appeals shaII be the Buﬁémg—

Saaa’ea—@m—z—@ematy—@ede—Board of Supemsors The frre code offlcral shaII be an
ex-officio member of said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the

board. The board shalt may adopt additional rules of procedure for conducting its
business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant
with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

(Ord. 4893 § 2 (part), 11/6/07;Ord. ,——/_)




SECTIONV

Section 12.10.150 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.150 Definitions.

General. Whenever in any of the Codes adopted hereby the following names or terms
are used, such name or term shall have the meaning ascribed to it by this section. I fthe
same tenn is defined in Chapter 2 of the 2007 California Building Code, then the
definition in this Chapter shall prevail. For any terms defined expressly for a particular
chapter or section of the Building Standard Codes adopted hereby, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those chapters.

Building; Official. “Building Official,” “Chief Building Inspector,” “Chief Electrical
Inspector,” “Chief Mechanical Inspector,” “Chief Plumbing Inspector,”
“Administrative Authority,” and all other terms and designations indicating the person
authorized and directed to carry out, enforce, and exercise government rights,
privileges, and duties shall, unless expressly indicated otherwise, mean the Building
Official and his or her duly authorized deputies, assistants and inspectors. The
“Building Official” is the Planning Director or his or her appointed designee.

Building; Department. The Office of the Planning Director.

The Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board. The appeals-board
estabhshedby—ﬂ&e—Board of SuperVISorS of the County of Santa Cruz—&s—&&theﬁzeé—by
Seetion] ] L ante -

theSaﬁta—Gfu-z—Getmty-Gede.

Building;and/or Property Service Equipment refers to the plumbing, mechanical,
electrical. and elevator equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures and other
accessories which provide sanitation, lighting, heating, ventilation, cooling,
refrigeration, fire-fighting and transportation facilities essential to the occupancy of the
building or structure for its designated use.

City. The County of Santa Cruz when referring to a political entity or an incorporated
area of said County when referring to area.

City Clerk. County Clerk; Ex Officio Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.
City Council. The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.

Commeiicement of Work. Shall be the completion of the first permanent work (not
including wells, septic tanks, grading or temporary power poles). Said permanent work

2

73/



13/

shall include footing and foundation materials such as poles, cassions, etc., signed off
by the building inspector with the concrete to be poured within five (5) days.

Fire Chief. The Chief Officer of the fire department serving the jurisdiction, or a duly
authorized agent.

Structure. That which is built or structured, as edifice or building of any kind, or any
piece of work artificially built up or composed of partsjoined together in some definite
manner.

Valuation or Value, as applied to a building and its building service equipment, shall
be as noted in the County of Santa Cruz Planning Department’s adopted Fee Schedule.
For purposes of calculating square footage refer to the definition of Area, Building in
section 502.1 of the 2007 California Building Code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07,;
Ord. ,

SECTIONVI

Section 12.10.435 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.435 Appeals. All appeals of actions taken pursuant to the provisions of this
chapter shall be made in conformance with the procedures set forth in Chapter 12.12.
The Buﬂdmg%eeessibﬂﬁy—%d#&e—@eée—:&ppea}s Board shall have no authority
relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of this code nor shall the
Board be: empowered to waive requirements of this code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part),
11/20/07; (Ord. /| /)

SECTIONVII

Section 12.12.010 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.010 Appeals to-Building;Aeeessib and-Fire-Code-Appeals Board

Any property owner or other person aggrleved or any person whose mterests are
adversely affected by any of the following acts or determinations of the Building
Official or of any other employee charged with the administration and enforcement of
the provisions of Chapter 12.10 may appeal the decision, order or determination as
hereunder provided-te-the Building-Acecessibility-and-Fire Code-AppealsBoard-created
by Chaprer2160-ef this Code:

(a)  Determinations of the suitability of alternate building materials and
methods of constructionfor use in this County.

(t)  Interpretations of the provisions of the Uniform Codes adopted by
Chapter 12.10 of the Santa Cruz County Code.

3



(c)  Actions taken in the enforcement of the requirements of Sections 19955,
et seq., of the Health and Safety Code relating to access to public accommodations by
persons with disabilities, including the ratification of hardship exceptions granted
pursuant to Section 19957.

(d)  Decisions, orders or determinations made by the fire code official relative
to the applicationand interpretation of Chapter 7.92 of this Code.

Tlhe Building-Aceessibility,and Fire-Code-Appeals Board appeals board shall
have no authority to amend, waive, or otherwise modify the requirements of this title,
the Uniform Codes adopted under this title, or Chapter 7.92 of this Code. (Ord. 4389A,
4/2/96; Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2368, 12/7/76;4202, 6/2/92; 4353, 2/14/95; Ord.
s 1)

SECTION VIII

Section 12.12.020 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.020 Notice of Appeal.

(a)  Appeals te-the-Building e E
shall be taken by filing a written Notlce of Appeal W|th the Plannlng Department within
fourteen calendar days after service of such decision, order, or determination appealed
from was made.

(b)  The filing fee established by Resolution of the Board of Supervisors shall
accompany the Notice of Appeal. (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2551, 4/18/78; 4500-C,
8/4/98; (Ord. L)

SECTION IX

Section 12.12.050 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.050 Setting for hearing.
Upon receipt of the Notice of Appeal, the matter shall be set for hearing befere

the Building-Aeccessibility;and-Eire-Code-AppealsBeard not later than 30 days
following the date on which the NOthC was filed or no later,than‘the ﬁrst regularly

sessior . Written notice of the time and place set for hearlng the appeal shaII be glven to
the appellant, and the officer whose decision, order, or determination is appealed from,
at least ten days prior to the hearing. Further notice shall be given in the same manner
as required for the original action appealed from. The department or officer involved in

the appeal shall transmit to the Building;Aceessibility-and Fire €ode-Appeals Board
all records related to the appeal and shall, upon request, furnish such additional

‘ 73./



72/

information relative to the proceedings as may be requested by the Building;
Aeeessibilivy;-and-Ti--Code—ppeals Board (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. /1)

SECTION X

Tlhis ordinance shall take effect and be operative on the 31* day after the date of
final passage.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of ,2009, by the
Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz by the following vote:
AYES: SUPERVISORS
NOES: SUPERVISORS

ABSENT: SUPERVISORS
ABSTAIN: SUPERVISORS

Chairperson, Board of Supervisors

Attest:
Clerk of the Board

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

County Counsel



ORDINANCE NO.

ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTER 2.100; SUBDIVISION (b) OF SECTION
12.10.215 AND SECTION 12.12.080; AND AMENDING SECTIONS 7.92.108.1,
12.10.150; 12.10.435; 12.12.010; 12.12.020; AND 12.12.050 OF THE SANTA
CRUZ COUNTY CODE RELATING TO THE HEARING OF BUILDING,
ACCESSIBILITY,AND FIRE CODE APPEALS

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz ordains as follows:
SECTIONI

Clhapter 2.100 of the Santa Cruz County Code entitled “Building and Fire Code
Appeals Board” is hereby repealed.

SECTIONII

Subdivision(b) of Section 12.10.215 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby
repealed.

SECTIONIII
Section 12.12.080 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby repealed.
SECTION IV

Section 7.92.108.1 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

7.92.108.1 Section 108.1 amended—Board of appeals established.
Section 108.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of Santa Cruz County is amended to
read as follows:

108.1 - Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official
relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is
hereby created a Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals shall be the Board of
Supervisors. The fire code official shall be an ex-officio member of said board
but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The board may adopt
additional rules of procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all
decisionsand findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire
code official.

(Ord. 4893 § 2 (part), 11/6/07; Ord.

SECTIONV
1

,— /)

73./



/0

75./

Section 12.10.150 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.150 Definitions.

General. Whenever in any of the Codes adopted hereby the following names or terms
are used, such name or term shall have the meaning ascribed to it by this section. If the
same tenn is defined in Chapter 2 of the 2007 California Building Code, then the
definition in this Chapter shall prevail. For any terms defined expressly for a particular
chapter or section of the Building Standard Codes adopted hereby, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those chapters.

Building; Official. “Building Official,” “Chief Building Inspector,” “Chief Electrical
Inspector,” “Chief Mechanical Inspector,” “Chief Plumbing Inspector,”
“Administrative Authority,” and all other terms and designations indicating the person
authorized and directed to carry out, enforce, and exercise government rights,
privileges, and duties shall, unless expressly indicated otherwise, mean the Building
Official and his or her duly authorized deputies, assistants and inspectors. The
“Building Official” is the Planning Director or his or her appointed designee.

Building; Department. The Office of the Planning Director.

The Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board. The Board of
Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.

Building; and/or Property Service Equipment refers to the plumbing, mechanical,
electrical and elevator equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures and other
accessories which provide sanitation, lighting, heating, ventilation, cooling,
refrigeration, fire-fighting and transportation facilities essential to the occupancy of the
building or structure for its designated use.

City. The County of Santa Cruz when refemng to a political entity or an incorporated
area of said County when referring to area.

City Clerk. County Clerk; Ex Officio Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.

City Council. The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.
Commeiicement of Work. Shall be the completion of the first permanent work (not
including wells, septic tanks, grading or temporary power poles). Said permanent work

shall include footing and foundation materials such as poles, cassions, etc., signed off
by the building inspector with the concrete to be poured within five (5) days.



/]

Fire Chief. The Chief Officer of the fire department serving the jurisdiction, or a duly
authorized agent.

Structure. That which is built or structured, as edifice or building of any kind, or any
piece of work artificially built up or composed of parts joined together in some definite
manner.

Valuation or Value, as applied to a building and its building service equipment, shall
be as noted in the County of Santa Cruz Planning Department’s adopted Fee Schedule.
For purposes of calculating square footage refer to the definition of Area, Building in
section 502.1 of the 2007 California Building Code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07,

od.___,_/ 1)
SECTION VI

Section 12.10.435 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.435 Appeals. All appeals of actions taken pursuant to the provisions of this
chapter shall be made in conformance with the procedures set forth in Chapter 12.12.
The Board shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative
provisions of this code nor shall the Board be empowered to waive requirements of this
code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07; (Ord. ,——)

SECTIONVII

Section 12.12.010 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.010 Appeals.

Any property owner or other person aggrieved, or any person whose interests are
adversely affected by any of the following acts or determinations of the Building
Official or of any other employee charged with the administration and enforcement of
the provisions of Chapter 12.10 may appeal the decision, order or determination as
hereunder provided:

(a)  Determinations of the suitability of alternate building materials and
methods of construction for use in this County.

(b) Interpretations of the provisions of the Uniform Codes adopted by
Chapter 12.10 of the Santa Cruz County Code.

(c)  Actions taken in the enforcement of the requirements of Sections 19955,
et seq., of the Health and Safety Code relating to access to public accommodations by
persons with disabilities, including the ratification of hardship exceptions granted
pursuant to Section 19957.

73/



/25

72./

(d)  Decisions, orders or determinations made by the fire code official relative
to the application and interpretation of Chapter 7.92 of this Code.

Tlhe appeals board shall have no authority to amend, waive, or otherwise modify
the requirements of this title, the Uniform Codes adopted under this title, or Chapter
7.92 of this Code. (Ord. 4389A, 4/2/96; Ord. 2281,4120176; Ord. 2368, 12/7/76;4202,

6/2/92; 4353,2114195:0rd. /)
SECTION VIII

Section 12.12.020 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.020 Notice of Appeal.

(@) Appeals shall be taken by filing a written Notice of Appeal with the
Planning Department within fourteen calendar days after service of such decision,
order, or determination appealed from was made.

(b)  Thefiling fee established by Resolution of the Board of Supervisors shall
accompany the Notice of Appeal. (Ord. 2281,4120176;0rd. 2551,4118178; 4500-C,
8/4/98; (Ord. /)

SECTION IX

Section 12.12.050 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.050 Setting for hearing.

Upon receipt of the Notice of Appeal, the matter shall be set for hearing not later
than 30 days following the date on which the Notice was filed or no later than the first
regularly scheduled meeting of the Board of Supervisors following the end of the 30
day period if the setting period ends during a time that the Board of Supervisors is not
in regular session. Written notice of the time and place set for hearing the appeal shall
be given to the appellant, and the officer whose decision, order, or determination is
appealed from, at least ten days prior to the hearing. Further notice shall be given in the
same manner as required for the original action appealed from. The department or
officer involved in the appeal shall transmit to the Board all records related to the
appeal and shall, upon request, furnish such additional information relative to the

proceedings as may be requested by the Board (Ord. 2281,4120176; Ord.
/1)

SECTION X

Tlhis ordinance shall take effect and be operative on the 31* day after the date of
final passage.



PASSED AND ADOPTED this

AYES: SUPERVISORS
NOES: SUPERVISORS
ABSENT: SUPERVISORS
ABSTAIN: SUPERVISORS

Attest:

/%

day of ,2009, by the
Board of Supervisorsof the County of Santa Cruz by the following vote:

Clerk of the Board
4ED FORM:
o

4
Cadnty Coungel

Chairperson, Board of Supervisors

73/



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Friday, May 29, 2009 8:06 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : david parks Email : Not Supplied
Address : Not Supplied Phone : Not Supplied
Comments :

Supervisor John Leopold
County of Santa Cruz
Board of Supervisors

Dear Supervisor Leopold:

It is with regret that | am having to tender my resignation to you as a member of the Building, Accessibility
and Fire Code Appeals Board for the County of Santa Cruz. | believe that both you and | had high hopes for
this Board and the possibility that it could have affected a positive change for the disenfranchised citizens of
our county. | want to thank you for the confidence that you placed in me by nominating me for this position.

Unfortunately, the state of the economy, and particularly how it has affected my profession, has made it
necessary for me to seek employment outside of the county for the first time in nearly 30 years. After now
having secured such a position, | am faced with the practical reality of relocating. As a consequence, my
wife and | have sold our home in Live Oak and are intending to move outside of the county, within the next
couple of months. When that occurs, | believe that | will become ineligible to continue to serve on the
Appeals Board.

Quite frankly, | was planning on putting off my resignation for as long as possible, that is, until we actually
moved out of the county. However, in light of the shenanigans that have occurred by actions of the County's
Planning Director and Assistant Directors, as well as the various county's counsel in collusion with your
Board's Chairperson, Mr. Niel Coonerty, now is clearly the perfect time to tender my resignation. My
distaste for such maneuvering is palpable, and | simply can not tolerate being associated with it, in any
manner, for a moment longer.

John, | hope you understand this.

With regrets, sincerity, and best wishes in your public career,

David D. Parks

73



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Friday, May 29, 2009 10:38 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL.

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : Travis Smith Email : travis@smith.net
Address : 437 larkin valley Phone : Not Supplied
Comments :

You have very qualified people appointed to the appeals board. They know state law because they are
trained and licensed. The planning department, as it now seems apparent under your direction, has been
using strange interpretations of the building codes for political leverage, power and worst of all revenge.

You have no more control over building codes. As of 1-1-08 everybody in california must follow 2007 ubc.
Any changes must be proven necessary and registered with the state.

Why would you want to hear disputes over building codes unless they were being illegally applied for

political reasons? You (the board) have no experience or training, just political ambitions. Please follow the
law.

6/1/2009 | 73 'l



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Saturday, May 30, 2009 7:34 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1

Name : Stanley Sokolow Email : Not Supplied
Address : Unincorporated Santa Cruz County Phone : Not Supplied
Comments :

| suggest that the proposed Ordinance section 7.92.108.1 be re-worded to resolve the ambiguous use of
the word "board": "The Board of Appeals shall be the Board of Supervisors. The fire code official shall be an
ex-officio member of said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the board." Although it could
be argued that the ambiguity is resolved by context, one could read the section as making the fire official an
ex-officio member of the Board of Supervisors.

Moreover, the double duty of the Board of Supervisors should be clarified by stating that when sitting as the
Board of Appeals, actions by the Supervisors are quasi-judicial administrative acts, not legislative acts. This
has implications with regard to the Brown Act and communications between an individual board member
and anyone else with an interest in the matter coming before the board.

6/1/2009 7 3 * '



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Saturday, May 30, 2009 7:49 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : Stanley Sokolow Email : Not Supplied
Address : Not Supplied Phone : Not Supplied
Comments :

Clarification of my prior message:

| have read that individual communications between members of a board or commission and members of
the public are permitted by the Brown Act. However, if a board will be acting on a quasi-judicial,
adjudicative matter (e.g., a land use variance or the revocation of a permit or license), all communications
between members of the board and anyone with an interest in the matter are required to take place at
formal meetings or through written communications that are made a part of the official record. This is not an

issue if the appeals board is not composed of the Board of Supervisors since an appointed board is not a
legislative body.

6/1/2009 7 3‘ I



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Sunday, May 31, 2009 6:07 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1

Name : Cove Britton Email : cove@matsonbritton.com
Address : Not Supplied Phone : 425-0544
Comments :

Dear Members of the Board:

As you are no doubt aware, at this time there is a Local Appeals Board. | would suggest that it is not the
intent of state code for the Board of Supervisors to disband the Local Appeals Board because the Board
disagrees with their interpretation of state code. Your board appointed five well qualified members, and the
proposed disbandment clearly flies in the face of why an independent board was necessary.

Thank you for the Boards' consideration.
Sincerely-

Cove Britton
Architect

6/1/2009 75 ) ’



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Saturday, May 30, 2009 3:01 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : Erik Zinn Email : enzinn@cruzio.com
Address : 2231 40th Avenue Phone : 8314642467

Santa Cruz, CA 95062

Comments :

There appears to be a quite a bit of controversy swirling around the recent appointment and activities of the
BAFCAB. Ms. Mauriello's and Ms. McRae's options seem somewhat limited and driven entirely by
assuming that there is no conflict or problems with the County Code. That assumption may prove fatal in
the long run, but | would like to ignore all of that for now.

| would like to pose a question in regard to a potential outcome on this agenda addenda: How well would
the public be served by the Supervisors acting as the BAFCAB?

The body that hears these appeals must be "knowledgeable in the California Building Standards Codes and
applicable local ordinances." (2007 California Building Code Section 108.8.1)

That is a pretty tall order for a local legislative represenative in light of all their other duties. Frankly, that is a
pretty tall order for anyone who hasn't spent a career studying the codes, such as a registered professional
(engineer, architect, geologist, etc.) or licensed contractor. | think that the intent of Building Standards
Commission in writing section 108.8.1 of the 2007 California Building Code was that the local legislative
body would appoint a board of appeals composed of professionals and licensed contractors, just like you
did earlier this year.

If you follow the recommended action, by Ms. Mauriello and Ms. McRae, you will be billing yourselves as
having the equivalent knowledge of a registered design professional (civil engineer, architect, geologist,
etc.) or a licensed contractor. Keep in mind that you are not allowed to rely upon the advice by the Planning
Department staff to guide your decisions for future specific appeals, because it is their decision that the
appellant is appealing. You will have to rely upon your knowledge and experience with the California
Building Standards and applicable local ordinances in making a decision on any given appeal.

Playing this out to its' logical end, | must ask another question: If an appellant decides to appeal your
decision to the State on a future appeal, how will the courts view your actions? | am assuming that the first
topic that would be explored by the legal system would be the qualifications of the invididuals that ruled on
the original appeal, which in this case would be yourselves. Unless you are proficient at using the California
Building Code and interpreting the intent of the California Building Code, you are not truly qualified to make
these decisions.

Surely there must be a better option available in this situation. | hope that cooler heads prevail and that the
current concept of the composition of the BAFCAB survives on Tuesday 2 June 2009. In my opinion, our

6/1/2009 773, '



community's health, safety and welfare and your constituents interests will be best served if the BAFCAB
continues to be composed of professionals and contractors licensed in the State of California.

6/1/2009



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Sunday, May 31, 2009 9:38 AM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : Cove Britton Email : cove@matsonbritton.com
Address : 728 N. Branciforte Phone : 425-0544

Santa Cruz, CA 95062

Comments :
Dear Members of the Board:

| think everyone can agree that governing by hyperbole is not for the benefit of the public.
Quite simply:

1. County staff is too provide support services to assist the sitting body (Board, Commission etc.) in
performing their duty as they perceive it. County staff chose another role, and that role was to attempt to
dictate what the Local Appeals board duties were. Whether the Board of Supervisors agrees with staff or
not, it is not county staffs' role to act as though they have the decisions making authority that is vested in
the Local Appeals Board.

County staff actions resulted in:

a. The resignation of the Chair Person, Michael Bethke.

b. Improperly prepared minutes.

c. Improperly prepared agendas.

d. Difficulty in scheduling hearings.

e. Regular interruptions by county staff where they provided their uninvited opinion.

f. Appeals that were properly filed, were prevented from being heard by county staff, despite legitimate
efforts of the board to do so.

2. The Local Appeals Board did specifically resolve that Special Meetings would be called to hear appeals
and Regular Meetings were to be used to address adoption of new By-Laws etc.County staff chose to
ignore that resolution.

| believe the Board of Supervisors has three basic options at this point:

A. Disband the Local Appeals Board and hear appeals themselves. As | have previously noted, this clearly
is a sidestepping of the intent of the state law regarding these issues, the Board of Supervisors is not
qualified to hear such appeals, it opens the county to liability and clear threats to the life, safety, and
welfare of the public, and ultimately is not the will of the public.

6/1/2009 ; 5 . I



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Sunday, May 31, 2009 5:31 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1
Name : Cove Britton Email : cove@matsonbritton.com

Address : Not Supplied Phone : 425-0544

Comments :
Certainly.

Regards,

Brad

From: Cove Britton [mailto:cove@matsonbritton.com]

Sent: Sunday, May 31, 2009 12:31 PM

To: 'Brad Neily'

Subject: RE: County of Santa Cruz Staff Proposal to Eliminate Buiding Appeals Board

Dear Mr. Neily,

Thank you very much for your e-mail.

May | forward it as appropriate?

Regards-
6/1/2009

7%



Cove Britton

Architect

From: Brad Neily [mailto:bneily@ucmerced.edu]

Sent: Sunday, May 31, 2009 10:31 AM

To: cove@matsonbrititon.com

Subject: County of Santa Cruz Staff Proposal to Eliminate Buiding Appeals Board

Dear Mr. Britton,

My name is Brad Neily and | read with interest the story in the Santa Cruz Sentinel regarding the above
subject.

I am a former resident of Santa Cruz (1980-95) having resettied in Merced, CA in 2005 as part of a career
transition from UCSC to come work at UC Merced.

One aspect of this proposal that may be overlooked that | simply wanted to mention has to do with the
interrelationship between accessibility, building code compliance and civil rights compliance regarding
persons with disabilities.

If | understand the proposal by the CAO, | would have no confidence in the qualifications of the Board of
Supervisors to be knowledgeable concerning the state's Title 24 code regarding access compliance nor,
depending on the funding source, the federal ADA Accessibility Guidelines (ADAAG).

The state of California's Title 24 accessibility code has not been certified by the DOJ (it is still under review)
as meeting ADAAG. There is a misplaced assumption that county staff, much less BOS reps, understand
that in order to ensure compliance with federal civil rights law - the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990
(ADA) - a code check must look to both Title 24 and ADAAG and determine which provides the greatest
degree of access.

The main point here is that access compliance in this context is also a matter of civil rights protection and

6/1/2009



Cove Britton

Architect

From: Brad Neily [mailto:bneily@ucmerced.edu]

Sent: Sunday, May 31, 2009 10:31 AM

To: cove@matsonbrititon.com

Subject: County of Santa Cruz Staff Proposal to Eliminate Buiding Appeals Board

Dear Mr. Britton,

My name is Brad Neily and | read with interest the story in the Santa Cruz Sentinel regarding the above
subject.

I am a former resident of Santa Cruz (1980-95) having resettied in Merced, CA in 2005 as part of a career
transition from UCSC to come work at UC Merced.

One aspect of this proposal that may be overlooked that | simply wanted to mention has to do with the
interrelationship between accessibility, building code compliance and civil rights compliance regarding
persons with disabilities.

If | understand the proposal by the CAO, | would have no confidence in the qualifications of the Board of
Supervisors to be knowledgeable concerning the state's Title 24 code regarding access compliance nor,
depending on the funding source, the federal ADA Accessibility Guidelines (ADAAG).

The state of California's Title 24 accessibility code has not been certified by the DOJ (it is still under review)
as meeting ADAAG. There is a misplaced assumption that county staff, much less BOS reps, understand
that in order to ensure compliance with federal civil rights law - the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990
(ADA) - a code check must look to both Title 24 and ADAAG and determine which provides the greatest
degree of access.

The main point here is that access compliance in this context is also a matter of civil rights protection and

6/1/2009



as such requires a high standard of professional qualifications, technical knowledge and awareness.

I would therefore make the argument that this CAO proposal also raises the risk of liability for the County by
removing a procedural review element to ensure state and federal accessibility compliance.

Regards,

Brad Neily - Coordinator

UC Merced Disability Services

6/1/2009



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent:  Monday, June 01, 2009 9:53 AM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1

Name : Rose Marie McNair Email : realrose@norcalbroker.com
Address : Not Supplied Phone : 831 212 4906

Comments :

Honorable Supervisors,

It is with deep sadness that | write this response to Chair Coonerty's letter and to the subsequent item 73.1.

For well over a year, the public has literally been clamoring for a qualified, dedicated Appeals Board, which
would follow the guidelines and parameters of State law, in particular, CBC 108.8--a law which has been
altered by local ordinances. To follow State law, or not--is the crux of the matter. Arguments favoring State
law have occurred repeatedly by many professionals and by attorneys, yet the County and County Counsel
continue to argue in favor of their amendments to State law. | am frankly, mystified, as to why the County
wants to change such a mandate, making the Board of Supervisors, who are elected, not as Building
professionals, but rather to follow the will of the people in their governance. The people WANT this Appeals
Board which is guided by CBC 108.8.

An Appeals Board is supposed to be composed of QUALIFIED PROFESSIONALS IN THE BUILDING
TRADES WITH EXPERTISE AND EXPERIENCE IN ALL TECHNICAL ASPECTS. The Board of
Supervisors should WELCOME the Appeals Board and its properly mandated State authority, as the means
to due process.

The appointments that the Board of Supervisors made were qualified professionals in the building trades--
architects, engineers, contractors...and they volunteered to do the job willingly without pay. They did NOT
obstruct the process--they were simply trying to properly navigate the law as licensees of the STATE.
Please allow them to do so! Please make your County ordinances follow the guidelines of State law.

Respectfully submitted,
Rose Marie McNair, Broker/REALTOR(R)
831 476 2102

PLEASE ENTER INTO THE RECORD. PLACING COPY FOR ITEM 73 AND 73.1.

6/1/2009 73 * l



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent: Monday, June 01, 2009 11:31 AM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1

Name : Richard Irish Email : richard@riengineering.com
Address : 303 Potrero St. Phone : 831.425.3901
Ste 42-202

Santa Cruz, CA 95060

Comments :
June 1, 2009

Board of Supervisors
County of Santa Cruz
701 Ocean Street
Santa Cruz, CA 95060

Subject: Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board
Dear Members of the Board:

As a member of the Building, Accessibility and Fire Code Appeals Board (BAFCAB) it is my duty to respond
to the letter by Dana McRae, Santa Cruz County Council and Susan A Mauriello, County Administrative
Officer dated May 29, 2009 (Agenda Items 73 and 73.1) and the letter from Supervisor Neil Coonerty to
your Board dated May 18, 2009.

When | was appointed to the BAFCAB it was my understanding that my duties as a member of BAFCAB
were to determine the suitability of alternative building methods, hear technical appeals based the
interpretation of Building, Fire and Accessibility codes, and to consider recommentations to the Board of
Supervisors concerning improvements to the building, grading, and fire regulations of the County. These
duties were defined in the Annual Report of the Building, Accessibility and Fire Appeals Board, dated
January 29, 2009. This is still my understanding of our role.

To me, the main disagreement between the BAFCAB and County Staff (as detailed in the above noted
letters) comes down to one issue. The requirement for an Appeals Board as detailed in the State of
California Building Codes is intended to provide due process for all appeals. The determinations of which
appeals are valid are to be decided by the Appeals Board. The County Codes do not include an
independent process for determining the validity of appeals. That decision is left up to County staff. A few
simple changes to County Code could address this conflict.

Firstly, | would first like to address the comments in the May 29, 2009 letter from Ms. McRae and Ms.
Mauriello that states "Statements made by BAFCAB members in the press and at public meetings indicate

6/1/2009 73, I



that belief that the County and its staff are acting in violation of State law."

At our second meeting it became clear that there were serious concerns regarding the deletion of Building
Standard 108.8 from the 2007 California Building Code (CBC) as specified in Section 12.10.215
subparagraph (b) of the Santa Cruz County Code. The concerns were voiced by members of the BAFCAB
and by members of the public. CBC Building Standard 108.8 is the standard requiring the establishment of
a Building Appeals Board. As a professional licensed by the state of California and someone who has taken
an oath of office to uphold the US Constitution and the Laws of the State of California, it is my duty to
uphold California State Law and my duty to understand if such a conflict exists. In discussions with Mr. Jim
McGowan (CSA lll, Program Operations Manager) of the State of California Department of Housing and
Community Development, | came to the understanding that Building Standards can only be modified with
express findings that are required due to local climactic, geological, or topographical conditions. In the case
of the deletion of Building Standard 108.8 no such determinations were made by Santa Cruz County staff
and in the case of an Appeals Board can't be made.

Further, the intent of Building Standard 108.8 is to provide due process for those seeking appeals by a
board of qualified members who are not employees of the County (Annual Report)

Upon reviewing the County codes 12.100 and 12.12, | determined that these codes did not comply with
Building Standard 108.8 in that they did not provide a method of vetting appeals by the BAFCAB. Indeed it
was explained to us at our second meeting by Mr. David Lee, Assistant Planning Director that county
planning staff had been trained to determine whether an appeal is valid. If the appellant does not agree with
planning staff they could ask to see the staff person's superior, and that person would make the
determination. Clearly, this does not meet the test of due process as required by the Building Standard
108.8.

However, | do feel that the County Codes can be revised to comply with State Law and indeed made a
motion at BAFCAB's third meeting, that was approved, to form a subcommittee to review the pertinent
County Codes 12.10.215, 12.100, and 12.12, and to make recommendations to the Board for revisions to
those Codes so that they would be in compliance with State Law. This is in keeping with our duties as
spelled out in the January 29, 2009 Annual Report to the Board, and as suggested by Mr. Tom Burns the
planning director in one of his email exchanges with another board member.

Secondly, | would like to address the statements in the May 29 letter from Ms. McRae and Ms Mauiriello
regarding our "failure" to hear appeals.

This argument makes no sense as the May 29, 2009 letter and the 2008 Annual Report both discuss the
fact that no valid appeals were filed in a very long time. If the appeals presented to us by the planning
department are the first two appeals filed in a long time, why is the timing of our hearing appeals now an
issue? In addition, the Watson appeal was filed in October 2008 and, due to staff misunderstandings that
appeal was not presented to the BAFCAB until April 2009. Again, if there is issue regarding the speed of
the hearing appeals why was that appeal not heard earlier be either the previous Appeals Board or the
Board of Supervisors?

We have had three meetings and we have had two appeals presented to us by planning staff. At our first
meeting we had no appeal before us and the meeting consisted mostly of public comment, election of
officers, and a presentation by the Planning Department's Council on the Brown Act.

The Watson appeal was included in our agenda for the second meeting. At the meeting Ms. Machado the
Appellant's representative asked that the appeal be continued until our adoption of bylaws was completed.
The item was continued as requested.

Between the second and third meeting the then BAFCAB Chairperson (Michael Bethke) resigned. _
Therefore, at our third meeting we had to elect new officers and proceed with a new Chairperson. This was

6/1/200973 . l



also the meeting in which Supervisor Coonerty presented his May 18, 2009 letter to the Board to BAFCAB.
Ms. Machado the representative of the Watson appeal again requested that their appeal be continued to a
later date. BAFCAB again complied.

The May 29th letter from Ms. McRae and Ms. Mauriello states the appellant for the Sunset Drive appeal
"initially implored the BAFCAB to move their appeal from the end of the agenda so that the final action
could take place that evening. This request was unfortunately denied." In fact, BAFCAB did move this
appeal forward from Agenda Item 10. To Agenda Item 8.5 in order to be able to hear the appeal that night.
We did run out of time and tried to schedule the continuance that night. County staff did not know when the
chambers would be available and the Fire Chief speaking on behalf of the fire district did not know when he
would be available, so the date of the continuance was to be determined subsequently.

BAFCAB members including myself did not support waiving of the ten day hearing notice as required by
Section 12.12.050 of the County Code.

Thirdly, the May 29, 2009 letter from Ms. McRae and Ms Mauriello states "Furthermore BAFCAB members
have seemingly ignored staff guidance regarding the requirements for communications under the open
meeting laws of the State, and appear to follow their own misguided legal conclusions."

If Ms. McRae and Ms. Mauriello are concerned about the BAFCAB members "misguided legal
conclusions", why are we not being provided legal support from their staff or from an outside consultant so
that we can operate with well guided legal advice? In a letter to the BAFCAB dated May 27, 2009, Ms
McRae stated "This letter will serve as notice that the County Counsel's Office will not provide legal advice
or representation to your Board. This action is required by our obligation to represent the interests of the
County of Santa Cruz." On one hand she is saying we are operating with poor legal advice, on the other
she is saying her office will not provide any advice. Also, it is my understanding that the role of the BAFCAB
is a part of Santa County Government.

Fourthly, the May 29, 2009 letter from Ms. McRae and Ms. Mauriello states that the BAFCAB has been
"seeking to reexamine the scope of its jurisdictional authority." As | stated previously, my understanding of
the BAFCAB's role is as defined in the Annual Report of the Building, Accessibility and Fire Appeals Board,
dated January 29, 2009. At no time have | been under the impression that my role was otherwise.

Lastly, both Superviscr Coonerty in his May 18, 2009 letter to the Board, and Ms. McRae and Ms. Mauriello
in their May 29 letter to the Board state that the BAFCAB is exposing the County to litigation. No
clarification is given in either letter explaining how the BAFCAB's actions are exposing the County to
litigation. To my knowledge, no advice by staff has been given to BAFCAB members as to how we should
modify actions so as not to expose the County to litigation.

Recommendation. | ask that the Board deny the motion by Ms. McRae and Ms. Mauriello to eliminate the
current BAFCAB. The BAFCAB can provide a valuable service to the people of our County by providing a
transparent process whereby people seeking appeals regarding building, fire, and accessibility can be
heard by an independent body of qualified persons. When functioning properly, we can help to protect our
County from litigation in that appellants will be afforded with the due process that the law requires.

| respectfully ask the following:

1. Amend County Codes 12.135.10, and 12.12 to comply with State Law in order to provide due process to
citizens filing appeal to the BAFCAB in this County.

2. Give the BAFCAB time to work out our operational difficulties.

3. Provide the BAFCAB with legal Council so that we operate within sound legal grounds.

4. In the meantime let the BAFCAB continue to operate in the areas in which we agree.

Thank you for your consideration in this matter.

6/1/2009 73' ’



Very Truly Yours

Richard J. Irish, PE
Member - Building Accessibility and Fire Code Appeal Board.

73|

6/1/2009



CBD BOSMAIL

From: CBD BOSMAIL

Sent: Monday, June 01, 2009 2:23 PM
To: CBD BOSMAIL

Subject: Agenda Comments

Meeting Date : 6/2/2009 Item Number : 73.1

Name : Cove Britton Email : cove@matsonbritton.com
Address : Not Supplied Phone : Not Supplied
Comments :

Dear Members of the Board:

Please pardon the multiple e-mails regarding this agenda item, but various points are coming forth as this
issue is broadly discussed.

The county deleted section 108. 8 in November 20, 2007. Section 108.8 does allow for the Board of
Supervisors to hear appeals as the Local Appeals Board (with all due respect, | believe the intent is that the
hearing body would still be required to be qualified to do so).

County code does not provide for the Board of Supervisors to act as the Local Appeals Board.

How does the county staff intend to justify unqualified members of the Board Supervisors to act as the
Local Appeals Board when they eliminated the state code giving authorization?

Thank you for the Boards' consideration.
Sincerely,

Cove Britton
Architect

6/1/2009 : 3 ' I



Revieed P4

ORDINANCE NO.

ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTER 2.100 AND SECTION 12.12.080; AND
AMENDING SECTIONS 7.92.108.1, 12.10.150; SUBDIVISION (b) OF SECTION
12.10.215; 12.10.435; 12.12.010; 12.12.020; AND 12.12.050 OF THE SANTA
CRUZ COUNTY CODE RELATING TO THE HEARING OF BUILDING,
ACCESSIBILITY, AND FIRE CODE APPEALS

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz ordains as follows:
SECTION I

Chapter 2.100 of the Santa Cruz County Code entitled “Building and Fire Code
Appeals Board” is hereby repealed.

SECTION 11
Section 12.12.080 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby repealed.
SECTION III

Section 7.92.108.1 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

7.92.108.1 Section 108.1 amended--Board of appeals established.
Section 108.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of Santa Cruz County is amended to
read as follows:

108.1 - Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official
relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is
hereby created a Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals shall be the Building;
Aeeessibility,-and Fire-Code-AppealsBoard-established by-Chapter 2. 100-of the
Santa-Cruz-County-Cede-Board of Supervisors. The fire code official shall be an
ex-officio member of said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the
board. The board shall may adopt additional rules of procedure for conducting its
business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant
with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

(Ord. 4893 § 2 (part), 11/6/07; Ord. , 1 /)

SECTION 1V

Section 12.10.150 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

73.1



Revised P °

12.10.150 Definitions.

General. Whenever in any of the Codes adopted hereby the following names or terms
are used, such name or term shall have the meaning ascribed to it by this section. If the
same term is defined in Chapter 2 of the 2007 California Building Code, then the
definition in this Chapter shall prevail. For any terms defined expressly for a particular
chapter or section of the Building Standard Codes adopted hereby, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those chapters.

Building Official. “Building Official,” “Chief Building Inspector,” “Chief Electrical
Inspector,” “Chief Mechanical Inspector,” “Chief Plumbing Inspector,”
“Administrative Authority,” and all other terms and designations indicating the person
authorized and directed to carry out, enforce, and exercise government rights,
privileges, and duties shall, unless expressly indicated otherwise, mean the Building
Official and his or her duly authorized deputies, assistants and inspectors. The
“Building Official” is the Planning Director or his or her appointed designee.

Building Department. The Office of the Planning Director.

The Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board. The appeals-board
es%&bhshed—by—ﬂae—Board of Superv1sors of the County of Santa Cruz—as—&ut:heﬂied-by

the—S&n&

Building and/or Property Service Equipment refers to the plumbing, mechanical,
electrical and elevator equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures and other
accessories which provide sanitation, lighting, heating, ventilation, cooling,
refrigeration, fire-fighting and transportation facilities essential to the occupancy of the
building or structure for its designated use.

City. The County of Santa Cruz when referring to a political entity or an incorporated
area of said County when referring to area.

City Clerk. County Clerk; Ex Officio Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.

City Council. The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.
Commencement of Work. Shall be the completion of the first permanent work (not
including wells, septic tanks, grading or temporary power poles). Said permanent work
shall include footing and foundation materials such as poles, cassions, etc., signed off

by the building inspector with the concrete to be poured within five (5) days.

Fire Chief. The Chief Officer of the fire department serving the jurisdiction, or a duly
authorized agent.



Rewsel P o

Structure. That which is built or structured, as edifice or building of any kind, or any
piece of work artificially built up or composed of parts joined together in some definite
manner.

Valuation or Value, as applied to a building and its building service equipment, shall
be as noted in the County of Santa Cruz Planning Department’s adopted Fee Schedule.
For purposes of calculating square footage refer to the definition of Area, Building in
section 502.1 of the 2007 California Building Code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07,

Od. _ , / /)
SECTION V

Subdivision (b) of Section 12.10.215 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

(b)  Administrative amendment -- Appeals Board. Section 108.8 of the
2007 California Building Code, Section 108.8 of the 2007 California Plumbing Code,
Section 89.108.8 of the 2007 California Electrical Code, and Section 108.8 of the 2007
California Mechanical Code, all relating to the “Appeals Board,” are deleted. The

Building;-Aeceessibility;-and Fire-Code-Appeals Board of Supervisors (See-Chapter

12-12-and-Chapter 2-100-of the-Santa-Cruz-County-Cede) shall serve as the local
appeals board required by Health and Safety Code Section 17920.5. (Ord. 5024,

11/25/08;00d. .,/ /)
SECTION VI

Section 12.10.435 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.435 Appeals. All appeals of actions taken pursuant to the provisions of this
chapter shall be made in conformance with the procedures set forth in Chapter 12.12.

The Building;-Acecessibility,-and Fire-Code-Appeals Board shall have no authority

relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of this code nor shall the
Board be empowered to waive requirements of this code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part),
11/20/07; (Ord. , 11 )

SECTION VII

Section 12.12.010 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.010 Appeals to-Bui




Revise] P-7

Any property owner or other person aggrieved, or any person whose interests are
adversely affected by any of the following acts or determinations of the Building
Official or of any other employee charged with the administration and enforcement of
the provisions of Chapter 12. 10 may appeal the de01510n order or determination as
hereunder provided-te-the d - de-Appe d-ere
by@hapater—Z—}O&ef—this—Geée

(a)  Determinations of the suitability of alternate building materials and
methods of construction for use in this County.

(b)  Interpretations of the provisions of the Uniform Codes adopted by
Chapter 12.10 of the Santa Cruz County Code.

(c)  Actions taken in the enforcement of the requirements of Sections 19955,
et seq., of the Health and Safety Code relating to access to public accommodations by
persons with disabilities, including the ratification of hardship exceptions granted
pursuant to Section 19957.

(d)  Decisions, orders or determinations made by the fire code official relative
to the application and interpretation of Chapter 7.92 of this Code.

The Buﬂdmg%eee%fbﬂkty—and—liﬂe-eeéeﬁppea}s%eafd appeals board shall
have no authority to amend, waive, or otherwise modify the requirements of this title,
the Uniform Codes adopted under this title, or Chapter 7.92 of this Code. (Ord. 4389A,
4/2/96; Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2368, 12/7/76; 4202, 6/2/92; 4353, 2/14/95; Ord.

s 1)

SECTION VIII

Section 12.12.020 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.020 Notice of Appeal.

(a)  Appeals to-the-Building essib : eals-Board
shall be taken by filing a wntten Notlce of Appeal w1th the Planmng Department within
fourteen calendar days after service of such decision, order, or determination appealed
from was made.

(b)  The filing fee established by Resolution of the Board of Supervisors shall
accompany the Notice of Appeal. (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2551, 4/18/78; 4500-C,
8/4/98; (Ord. , | 1 )

SECTION IX

Section 12.12.050 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.050 Setting for hearing.
Upon receipt of the Notice of Appeal, the matter shall be set for hearing before

the-Building-Aeceessibility-and Fire-Code-Appeals-Board not later than 30 days

4



session. ertten notice of the time and place set for hearmg the appeal shall be glven to
the appellant, and the officer whose decision, order, or determination is appealed from,
at least ten days prior to the hearing. Further notice shall be given in the same manner
as required for the original action appealed from. The department or officer involved in
the appeal shall transmit to the BuildingAeceessibility-and Fire- Code-Appeals Board
all records related to the appeal and shall, upon request, furnish such additional
information relative to the proceedings as may be requested by the Building;

Accessibility-and-Fire-Code-Appeals Board (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76;0rd. _ , / /)
SECTION X

This ordinance shall take effect and be operative on the 31% day after the date of
final passage.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of , 2009, by the
Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz by the following vote:
AYES: SUPERVISORS
NOES: SUPERVISORS

ABSENT: SUPERVISORS
ABSTAIN: SUPERVISORS

Chairperson, Board of Supervisors

Attest:
Clerk of the Board

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

County Counsel



Revied P9
ORDINANCENO.

ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTER 2.100 AND SECTION 12.12.080; AND
AMENDING SECTIONS 7.92.108.1, 12.10.150; SUBDIVISION (b) OF SECTION
12.10.215; 12.10.435; 12.12.010; 12.12.020; AND 12.12.050 OF THE SANTA
CRUZ COUNTY CODE RELATING TO THE HEARING OF BUILDING,
ACCESSIBILITY, AND FIRE CODE APPEALS

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz ordains as follows:
SECTION I

Chapter 2.100 of the Santa Cruz County Code entitled “Building and Fire Code
Appeals Board” is hereby repealed.

SECTION II
Section 12.12.080 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby repealed.
SECTION III

Section 7.92.108.1 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

7.92.108.1 Section 108.1 amended--Board of appeals established.
Section 108.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of Santa Cruz County is amended to
read as follows:

108.1 - Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the fire code official
relative to the application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is
hereby created a Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals shall be the Board of
Supervisors. The fire code official shall be an ex-officio member of said board
but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The board may adopt
additional rules of procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all
decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire
code official.

(Ord. 4893 § 2 (part), 11/6/07; Ord. , 1)

SECTION 1V

Section 12.10.150 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.150 Definitions.

73.1



Revssed 10

General. Whenever in any of the Codes adopted hereby the following names or terms
are used, such name or term shall have the meaning ascribed to it by this section. If the
same term is defined in Chapter 2 of the 2007 California Building Code, then the
definition in this Chapter shall prevail. For any terms defined expressly for a particular
chapter or section of the Building Standard Codes adopted hereby, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those chapters.

Building Official. “Building Official,” “Chief Building Inspector,” “Chief Electrical
Inspector,” “Chief Mechanical Inspector,” “Chief Plumbing Inspector,”
“Administrative Authority,” and all other terms and designations indicating the person
authorized and directed to carry out, enforce, and exercise government rights,
privileges, and duties shall, unless expressly indicated otherwise, mean the Building
Official and his or her duly authorized deputies, assistants and inspectors. The
“Building Official” is the Planning Director or his or her appointed designee.

Building Department. The Office of the Planning Director.

The Building, Accessibility, and Fire Code Appeals Board. The Board of
Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.

Building and/or Property Service Equipment refers to the plumbing, mechanical,
electrical and elevator equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures and other
accessories which provide sanitation, lighting, heating, ventilation, cooling,
refrigeration, fire-fighting and transportation facilities essential to the occupancy of the
building or structure for its designated use.

City. The County of Santa Cruz when referring to a political entity or an incorporated
area of said County when referring to area.

City Clerk. County Clerk; Ex Officio Clerk of the Board of Supervisors.
City Council. The Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz.

Commencement of Work. Shall be the completion of the first permanent work (not
including wells, septic tanks, grading or temporary power poles). Said permanent work
shall include footing and foundation materials such as poles, cassions, etc., signed off
by the building inspector with the concrete to be poured within five (5) days.

Fire Chief. The Chief Officer of the fire department serving the jurisdiction, or a duly
authorized agent.

Structure. That which is built or structured, as edifice or building of any kind, or any
piece of work artificially built up or composed of parts joined together in some definite
manner.



(&V\.SQA ? { ‘

Valuation or Value, as applied to a building and its building service equipment, shall
be as noted in the County of Santa Cruz Planning Department’s adopted Fee Schedule.
For purposes of calculating square footage refer to the definition of Area, Building in
section 502.1 of the 2007 California Building Code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07;

od. ., / /)
SECTION V

Subdivision (b) of Section 12.10.215 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

(b)  Administrative amendment -- Appeals Board. Section 108.8 of the
2007 California Building Code, Section 108.8 of the 2007 California Plumbing Code,
Section 89.108.8 of the 2007 California Electrical Code, and Section 108.8 of the 2007
California Mechanical Code, all relating to the “Appeals Board,” are deleted. The
Board of Supervisors_shall serve as the local appeals board required by Health and
Safety Code Section 17920.5. (Ord. 5024, 11/25/08;0rd. _ , / /)

SECTION VI

Section 12.10.435 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.10.435 Appeals. All appeals of actions taken pursuant to the provisions of this
chapter shall be made in conformance with the procedures set forth in Chapter 12.12.
The Board shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative
provisions of this code nor shall the Board be empowered to waive requirements of this
code. (Ord. 4894 § 2 (part), 11/20/07; (Ord. , 1)

SECTION VII

Section 12.12.010 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.010 Appeals.

Any property owner or other person aggrieved, or any person whose interests are
adversely affected by any of the following acts or determinations of the Building
Official or of any other employee charged with the administration and enforcement of
the provisions of Chapter 12.10 may appeal the decision, order or determination as
hereunder provided:

(a)  Determinations of the suitability of alternate building materials and
methods of construction for use in this County.



Revi] ®.12-

(b) Interpretations of the provisions of the Uniform Codes adopted by
Chapter 12.10 of the Santa Cruz County Code.

(c)  Actions taken in the enforcement of the requirements of Sections 19955,
et seq., of the Health and Safety Code relating to access to public accommodations by
persons with disabilities, including the ratification of hardship exceptions granted
pursuant to Section 19957.

(d)  Decisions, orders or determinations made by the fire code official relative
to the application and interpretation of Chapter 7.92 of this Code.

The appeals board shall have no authority to amend, waive, or otherwise modify
the requirements of this title, the Uniform Codes adopted under this title, or Chapter
7.92 of this Code. (Ord. 4389A, 4/2/96; Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2368, 12/7/76; 4202,
6/2/92; 4353, 2/14/95; Ord. , |1 )

SECTION VIII

Section 12.12.020 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.020 Notice of Appeal.

(a)  Appeals shall be taken by filing a written Notice of Appeal with the
Planning Department within fourteen calendar days after service of such decision,
order, or determination appealed from was made.

(b)  The filing fee established by Resolution of the Board of Supervisors shall
accompany the Notice of Appeal. (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord. 2551, 4/18/78; 4500-C,
8/4/98; (Ord. , | 1 )

SECTION IX

Section 12.12.050 of the Santa Cruz County Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

12.12.050 Setting for hearing.
Upon receipt of the Notice of Appeal, the matter shall be set for hearing not later
than 30 days following the date on which the Notice was filed or no later than the first
regularly scheduled meeting of the Board of Supervisors following the end of the 30
day period if the setting period ends during a time that the Board of Supervisors is not
in regular session. Written notice of the time and place set for hearing the appeal shall
be given to the appellant, and the officer whose decision, order, or determination is
appealed from, at least ten days prior to the hearing. Further notice shall be given in the
same manner as required for the original action appealed from. The department or
officer involved in the appeal shall transmit to the Board all records related to the
appeal and shall, upon request, furnish such additional information relative to the
proceedings as may be requested by the Board (Ord. 2281, 4/20/76; Ord.

1)

_



Revset ©.13

SECTION X

This ordinance shall take effect and be operative on the 31* day after the date of
final passage.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of , 2009, by the
Board of Supervisors of the County of Santa Cruz by the following vote:
AYES: SUPERVISORS
NOES: SUPERVISORS

ABSENT: SUPERVISORS
ABSTAIN: SUPERVISORS

Chairperson, Board of Supervisors

Attest:
Clerk of the Board

Coupfy Counsél/







